
1/19/2021 OA12 - OneDrive

https://meetmatt-my.sharepoint.com/personal/alex_meetmatt_net/_layouts/15/onedrive.aspx?originalPath=aHR0cHM6Ly9tZWV0bWF0dC1teS5z… 1/1

Office 365  

  New   Upload   Download  Sort    

 AOGS Society Matters AOGS Past Abstracts AOGS&APHW2004 AOGS 

 Name  Modified  Modified By 

57-OOA-A1028.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1117.htm57-OOA-A1117 December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1300.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1508.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1535.doc December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1590.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1661.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1767.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1842.doc December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1842.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1843.doc December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A1843.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A206.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A288.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A289.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A323.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A338.doc December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A338.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

57-OOA-A388.htm December 21, 2020 Alex Ang

  Abstract Details 

 AOGS 1st Annual Meeting > Ocean and Atmospheres > Role of the Tibetan Plateau Therma
Mechanical Forcing in the Summer Climate Patterns over subtropical Asia >

Corresponding Author :  Dr. Anmin Duan (amduan@lasg.iap.ac.cn)  

Organization:  Institute of atmospheric physics

Category:  Ocean and Atmospheres

Paper ID:  57-OOA-A1117
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Abstract:
 Numerical simulations by using IAP/LASG GOALS climate model and 
data analysis are carried out to investigate how the Tibetan Plateau (T
orography, sensible heating, as well as latent heating affect the summ
circulation and climate patterns over the subtropical Asia. It is shown 
the TP thermal effect, which is mainly depended on the monsoon
precipitation induced latent heat release, is dominant in summer seas
combination of the surface sensible heating and upper-level latent he
results in air flows toward the midst of the TP and converges there, th
generates a low-level cyclonic circulation around the TP and a anticyc
circulation above it. However, comparing to the thermal aspect, the p
mechanical forcing of the orography plays a reversed role in the circu
pattern over the TP. According to the steady barotropic vorticity equat
large-scale, airflows must converge in the low layers and diverge in th
layers over the east side of TP. However, the west side of TP is charac
by a reversed structure, i.e., divergence in low layers but convergenc
high layers. Hence pumping and sucking processes result in upward a
downward movement over the east and west side of TP, respectively.
Moreover, in lower layers, Sverdrup vorticity balance implies equatorw
flow in the descent region and poleward flow in the ascent region. The
opposition of circulation and vertical motion induced by the heating ef
the TP therefore generate the basic climate pattern, which is characte
by wet in east flank but droughty in west flank of the plateau, in sum
subtropical Asia. Such configurations are modified to some extent by 
diabatic heating and orography.
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